11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

(Published in the Topeka Metro News August 25, 2025)
ORDINANCE NO. 20595
AN ORDINANCE introduced by City Manager Dr. Robert M. Perez, adopting the 2024
Uniform Mechanical Code to replace the 2015 edition, amending
and repealing sections of Chapter 14.50 of the Topeka Municipal
Code.
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF TOPEKA, KANSAS:
Section 1.  That section 14.50.010, Uniform Mechanical Code - Adopted, of
The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Uniform Mechanical Code — Adopted.
There is hereby adopted by reference the 20452024 Uniform Mechanical Code,
2730th Edition, published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials. The code shall include all appendices to the 20452024 Uniform Mechanical

Code. The code is hereby adopted as the mechanical code of the City and incorporated

herein as if fully set out in this chapter. The 2024 Uniform Mechanical Code lllustrated

Training Manual as published by the International Association of Plumbing and

Mechanical Officials may be considered and applied by the authority having jurisdiction

to the extent necessary in the authority’s sole discretion to implement and enforce this

code.

Section 2.  That section 14.50.050 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 1



29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025



52

53

54

95

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

73

74

Section 3.  That section 14.50.060 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

Section4. That section 14.50.070 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 3



75

76

77

78

79

80

81

82

83

84

85

86

87

88

89

90

91

92

93

94

95

96

97

is hereby repealed.

Section 5.  That section 14.50.080 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 4



98

99

100

101

102

103

104

105

106

107

108

109

110

111

112

113

114

115

116

117

118

119

120

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 5



121

122

123

124

125

126

127

128

129

130

131

132

133

134

135

136

137

138

139

140

141

142

143

Section 6.  That section 14.50.090 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 6



144

145

146

147

148

149

150

151

152

153

154

155

156

157

158

159

160

161

162

163

164

165

166

Section 7.  That section 14.50.100, Chapter 5, Section 507.1.5, of The Code of
the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.050 and amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 5, Section 507-1.5508.1.

Chapter 5, Section 86#44-5508.1, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following provisions shall be substituted therefor:

Cooking equipment that has been listed in accordance with UL 197 or an
equivalent standard for reduced emissions shall be required to be submitted to the
Mechanical Review Board for approval to be used without an exhaust system. All
manufacturer’s product data and installation instructions shall be submitted.

Section 8.  That section 14.50.110, Chapter 5, Section 510.3.2, of The Code of
the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.060 and amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 5, Section 510.3.21.

Chapter 5, Section 510.3.21, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
provisions shall be substituted therefor:

For hoods with dampers in the supply collar, an access panel for cleaning and
inspection shall be provided in the duct or the hood collar. For Type | duct system,
dampers shall not be permitted in the exhaust collar or in the exhaust duct. This access
panel shall be as close to the hood as possible but shall not exceed eighteen (18)
inches (457.2 mm).

Exception: Dampers that are accessible from under the hood.

Section 9.  That section 14.50.115 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 7



167

168

169

170

171

172

173

174

175

176

177

178

179

180

181

182

183

184

185

186

187

188

189

is hereby repealed.

Section 10. That section 14.50.120 of The Code of the City of Topeka,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 8

Kansas,




190

191

192

193

194

195

196

197

198

199

200

201

202

203

204

205

206

207

208

209

210

211

212

Section 11. That section 14.50.130 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

Section 12. That section 14.50.140 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 9



213

214

215

216

217

218

219

220

221

222

223

224

225

226

227

228

229

230

231

232

233

234

235

Section 13. That section 14.50.150, Chapter 5, Section 513.0 through 513.11,

Fire-Extinguishing Equipment, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby
renumbered as 14.50.070 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 5, Sections 513.0 through 513.4413, Fire-Extinguishing Equipment.

Chapter 5, Section 513.0 through Section 513.4413, Fire-Extinguishing
Equipment, are hereby deleted in their entirety and the following provisions shall be
substituted therefor:

Fire-extinguishing equipment shall be governed by the currently adopted Fire
Code of the City of Topeka.

Section 14. That section 14.50.160, Chapter 5, Sections 514.0 through 514.4,
Procedures for Use and Maintenance of Equipment, of The Code of the City of Topeka,
Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.080 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 5, Sections 514.0 through 514.45.1, Procedures for Use and
Maintenance of Equipment.

Chapter 5, Section 514.0 through Section 514.45.1, Procedures for Use and
Maintenance of Equipment, are hereby deleted in their entirety and the following
provisions shall be substituted therefor:

Procedures for the use and maintenance of equipment shall be governed by the
currently adopted Fire Code of the City of Topeka.

Section 15. That section 14.50.170, Chapter 5, Sections 515.0 through 515.3,

Minimum Safety Requirements for Cooking Equipment, of The Code of the City of

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 10



236

237

238

239

240

241

242

243

244

245

246

247

248

249

250

251

252

253

254

255

256

257

258

Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.090 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 5, Sections 515.0 through 515.32, Minimum Safety Requirements
for Cooking Equipment.

Chapter 5, Section 515.0 through Section 515.32, Minimum Safety Requirements
for Cooking Equipment, are hereby deleted in their entirety and the following provisions
shall be substituted therefor:

Minimum safety requirements for cooking equipment shall be governed by the
currently adopted Fire Code of the City of Topeka.

Section 16. That section 14.50.180, Chapter 5, Sections 516.0 through 516.6,
Recirculating Systems, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby
renumbered as 14.50.100 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 5, Sections 516.0 through 516.6.6, Recirculating Systems.

Chapter 5, Section 516.0 through Section 516.6.6, Recirculating Systems, are
hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 17. That section 14.50.190, Chapter 5, Section 517.7, Fire-
Extinguishing Equipment for Solid-Fuel Cooking, of The Code of the City of Topeka,
Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.110 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 5, Section 517.7, Fire-Extinguishing Equipment for Solid-Fuel
Cooking.

Chapter 5, Section 517.7, Fire-Extinguishing Equipment for Solid-Fuel Cooking,
is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following provisions shall be substituted therefor:

Fire-extinguishing equipment for solid-fuel cooking requirements shall be

governed by the currently adopted Fire Code of the City of Topeka.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 11



259

260

261

262

263

264

265

266

267

268

269

270

271

272

273

274

275

276

277

278

279

280

281

Section 18. That section 14.50.200, Chapter 5, Section 517.8.4, of The Code of
the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.120 and amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 5, Section 517.8.43.

Chapter 5, Section 517.8.4, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
provisions shall be substituted therefor:

No solid-fuel cooking device of any type shall be permitted for deep-fat frying nor
shall any solid-fuel cooking device be permitted within three (3) feet (0.92 m) of any
deep-fat frying unit.

Section 19. That section 14.50.210 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 12



282

283

284

285

286

287
288
289
290
291
292
293
294

295 See—GChapter5forlimitations—onr—envirenmentalair—systems—exhaust—duets
296

297

298

299 Section 20. That section 14.50.215 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,
300 is hereby repealed.

301
302
303

304

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 13



305

306

307

308

309

310

311

312

313

314 Section 21. That section 14.50.220 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,
315 is hereby repealed.

316 Chapter 6, Table 6-6 B-{I-P-Units), Notes.

317
318
319
320
321
322

323

324
325 b-necludes-crawl-spaces,-both-ventilated-and-nonventilated-:
326

327

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 14



328
329
330
331
332

333 o f Toncka_ iurisdict hall Envel ~riteria_Table_5-15_for
334 climatezone-

335 Section 22. That section 14.50.230 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,
336 is hereby repealed.

337
338
339
340
341

342

343
344 Section 23. That section 14.50.240 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,
345 is hereby repealed.

346 Chapter 7, Section 701.8.2.

347
348
349

350

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 15



351 hanical ai | , . ion.
352 Section 24. That section 14.50.250 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

353 is hereby repealed.
354

355

356

357

358

359

360

361

362

363

364
365 £3)-Buets-shall-serve-a-single-spaceINFPA-54:-6-3-8-3}
366

367

368
369 54:8.3.8.4]
370
371
372

373

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 16



374

375

376

377

378

379

380

381

382

383
384 Section 25. That section 14.50.255 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,
385 is hereby repealed.

386
387
388
389
390
391
392
393

394

395

396

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 17



397

398

399

400

401

402

403

404

405

406

407

408

409

410

411

412

413

414

415

416

417

418

419

Section 26. That section 14.50.260 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

Section 27. That section 14.50.270, Chapter 9, Section 924.1.1, of The Code of

the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as 14.50.130 and amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 9, Section 924915.3.1.1.

Chapter 9, Section 924915.3.1.1, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following provisions shall be substituted therefor:

Unvented room heaters shall not be installed in bathrooms or bedrooms. [NFPA
54:10.23.1] This subsection shall not apply to portable oil fired unvented heating
appliances used as supplemental heating in Group S, Divisions 3, 4, and 5, and Group
U occupancies, and regulated by the Fire Code.

No Exceptions.

Section 28. That section 14.50.280, Chapter 9, Section 925.0, Stationary Gas

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 18



420

421

422

423

424

425

426

427

428

429

430

431

432

433

434

435

436

437

438

439

440

441

442

Engines, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby renumbered as
14.50.150 and amended to read as follows:

Chapter 916, Section 9251602.0, Stationary Gas Engines.

Chapter 916, Section 9251602.0, Stationary Gas Engines, is hereby deleted in its
entirety.

Section 29. That section 14.50.285 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

Section 30. That section 14.50.290 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 19



443

444

445

446

447

448

449

450

451

452

453

454

455

456

457

458

459

460

461

462

463

464

465

Section 31. That The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended

by adding a section, to be numbered 14.50.140, which said section reads as follows:
h ri ion 1311.3. Arc Resistan k T

Chapter 13, Section 1311.3, Arc Resistant Jacketed CSST, is hereby deleted in

its entirety.
Section 32. That section 14.50.300 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas,

is hereby repealed.
Chapter 14, P Pinina.
S 4P Pining. s by deleted in i oty
Section 33. That original § 14.50.010, § 14.50.100, § 14.50.110, § 14.50.150

through § 14.50.180, § 14.50.200, § 14.50.270 and § 14.50.280 of The Code of the City

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 20



466

467

468

469

470

471

472

473

474
475
476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487

of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby specifically repealed.

Section 34. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force effective 90 days
after its passage, approval and publication in the official City newspaper.

Section 35. This ordinance shall supersede all ordinances, resolutions or rules,
or portions thereof, which are in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance.

Section 36. Should any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance be declared
invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity of this
ordinance as a whole, or any part thereof, other than the part so declared to be invalid.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the Governing Body on August 19, 2025.

CITY OF TOPEKA, KANSAS

Michael A. Padilla, Mayor
ATTEST:

Brenda Younger, City Clerk

ORD/Adopt 2024 UMC 4/22/2025 21



	13 Uniform Mechanical Code – Adopted.
	25 Chapter 2, Section 208.0, F.
	64 Chapter 4, Section 406.0, Screened Openings.
	76 Chapter 4, Section 407.0, Outside Air Location.
	96 Chapter 4, Section 408.0, Return Air Location.
	134 Chapter 5, Section 504.3.2.2, Length Limitation.
	147 Chapter 5, Section 507.1.5508.1.
	157 Chapter 5, Section 510.3.21.
	168 Chapter 5, Section 510.5.6.
	182 Chapter 5, Section 510.7.1.
	200 Chapter 5, Section 511.2.1.
	210 Chapter 5, Section 511.4, Common Duct (Manifold) Systems.
	218 Chapter 5, Sections 513.0 through 513.1113, Fire-Extinguishing Equipment.
	227 Chapter  5,   Sections  514.0   through  514.45.1,   Procedures   for  Use  and
	237 Chapter 5, Sections 515.0  through 515.32, Minimum Safety    Requirements
	247 Chapter 5, Sections 516.0 through 516.6.6, Recirculating Systems.
	253 Chapter  5,  Section  517.7,  Fire-Extinguishing  Equipment  for     Solid-Fuel
	262 Chapter 5, Section 517.8.43.
	270 Chapter 6, Section 602.1, General.
	301 Chapter 6, Section 602.4.
	316 Chapter 6, Table 6-6 B (I-P Units), Notes.
	337 Chapter 7, Section 701.1.5, Prohibited Sources.
	346 Chapter 7, Section 701.8.2.
	354 Chapter 7, Section 701.10, Combustion Air Ducts.
	386 Chapter 9, Section 904.3.1.
	402 Chapter 9, Section 904.10.3.2.
	411 Chapter 9, Section 924915.3.1.1.
	422 Chapter 916, Section 9251602.0, Stationary Gas Engines.
	427 Chapter 11, Section 1107.6.
	440 Chapter 13, Section 1312.4, Equipment Shutoff Valves and Connections.
	457 Chapter 13, Section 1311.3, Arc Resistant Jacketed CSST
	462 Chapter 14, Process Piping.

